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Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Procurement Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Project P 1 etayr | Wedeot - (brief description of
End-User (Yes/No) Procurement | Advertisement/|Submission Funds - 1
Notice of Contract roject)
Posting of |/Opening of Aviard Sianin Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids e
[~ 10000010000 1000 e : :
Rebidding for the Supply and . Provision of various office
3101001?? OC DE 1000 Iryelivery of Various Office Supplies AD NO Competitive | ¢oao021 | 711472021 NIA N/A GoP 2,713,113.83) 2,713,113.83| supplies for PHilMech
3101001 e for the 3rd Quarter of 2021 Bidding offices
310100100003000
100000100001000  JRebidding for the Supply and Provision of various I.T.
310100100001000 Delivery of Various |.T. Equipment Competitive equipment and other related
310100100002000 Jand Other Related Supplies forthe | ™M e Bidding VRN ) TR WA N Geb St mros i supplies for PHilMech
310100100003000 3rd Quarter of 2021 offices
;Sgsgglgglﬁ Supply and Deiivery of Various Competitive
310100100002000 Office Supplies for the 4th Quarter AD NO Biddi 7/9/2021 8/6/2021 10/20/2021 11/3/2021 GoP 1,802,841.04 1,802,841.04
of 2021, Lot 1 g Provision of various office
210100100003000 supplies for PHilMech
100000100001000 . .
310100100001000 | SuPPlY and Delivery of Various Competitive n—
Office Supplies for the 4th Quarter AD NO ee 7/9/2021 B/6/2021 | 10/20/2021 11/3/2021 GoP 245,969.50 245,969.50
310100100002000 of 2021 Lot 2 Bidding
310100100003000 :
100000100001000 Supply and Delivery of Various |.T Provision of various |.T.
310100100001000  }e . iomant and Other Related PMITD NO Competitve | 7190001 | 8612021 /A NIA GoP 4,369,405.00 4,369,405.00| Bt el ci: NS
310100100002000 Supplies for the 4th Quarter of 2021 Bidding supplies for PHilMech
310100100003000 i offices
ICommissioning/Testing and prﬂ;ﬂ:':;i:gi:‘;"ai
EM——— NP-53.1 Two Infrastructure (HC)
310200100001000 Hyperconverged Infrastructure (HCI) AD YES ; G 8/10/2021 N/A 9/14/2021 9/28/2021 GoP 5,450,000.004 5,450,000.00 : Aty
. g Failed Biddings (2 Units HPE Simplivity 380
(2 Units HPE Simplivity 380 Gen 10 Gen 10 Server Node) for
Peree Nooe) the PHilMech server
Supply of Labor and Materials for Fabrication, Delivery,
the Fabrication, Delivery, Installation Competitive Installation and Testing of
310100100003000 Jand Testing of 2 units Research AMD NO Bidpdein 11/5/2021 11/28/2021 ongoing GoP 5,664,642.90] 5,664,642.90] Research Prototype of
Prototype of Fluidized Bed Drying 9 Fluidized Bed Drying
System in Isabela System in Isabela
Supply of Labor and Materials for &5 .
{ g " Fabrication, Delivery,
gk e it ard Tos o
310100100003000 | ' 9 0.« U AMD NO ompetitve 1 yusr2021 | 117202021 N/A N/A GoP 3,490,648.00] 3,490,648.00] Research Prototype of
esearch Prototype of Greenhouse Bidding Greenhouse Type Solar
Yo Sk Deyar: by Crenin Dryer in Quezon Province
Province
Rebidding for the Supply of Labor e "
and Materials for the Fabrication, Onj Ins:::lll; :‘;t";’:‘ do;t":"r:é P
310100100003000 |31 Dettvery, Installation and AMD NO Competitive | 15142021 | 1111712022 ongoing GoP 4,082,686.44 4,082,686.44 Research Prototype of
esting of Research Prototype of Bidding Greenhouse Type Solar
Greenhouse Type Solar Dryer in Dryer in Quezon Province
Quezon




Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021

(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Procurement Remarks
PMO/ : Mode of Source of
i Activity? .
Code (PAP) Procurement Project End-User ity | Procurement nUISubmmion Funda (brief description of
(Yes/No S " Notice of | Contract Project)
Posting of |/Opening of! Avoneld Signin Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids gning
Subscription Renewal of Sophos Subscription Renewal of
310100100001000  [LGS-4300 Extreme PMITD NO Competitive | 44112021 | 1232021 NIA NIA GoP 1,650,000.00| 1,650,000.00 Spop:‘ (:;'X(ise.“(']lo E:t Web,
Protection+Email and Web Server Bidding L Rl S (SRR T g e
: Server Protection For 3
Protection For 3 Years
Years
Supply and Delivery of Various Competitive Provision of various Office
310200100001000 JOffice Furniture and Fixtures for the EDD NO Bidding 11/24/2021 12/16/2021 ongoing GoP 4,836,000.00] 4,836,000.00 Furniture and Fixtures for
IAFMechERN Building the AFMechERN Building
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 88 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Biddin 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 114,206,400.00 114,206,400.00] machinery under RCEF
Regions CAR, 1 & Il 9 Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 72 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 JUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Biddin 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 816/2021 Purpose 93,441,600.00 93,441,600.00] machinery under RCEF
Regions Ill, IV-A, IV-B and V 9 Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 46 Competitve Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 JUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO T 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/13/2021 Purpose 59,708,000.00 59,708,000.00] machinery under RCEF
; Bidding ol S
\Visayas (Regions VI VIl & VIII) Fund Mechanization Program
, Deli ing of 56 . A )
Unis FourWhaei Tractors for Competiive Spec Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 3 ¢ FMFOD NO MR 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/12/2021 Purpose 72,688,000.00 72,688,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Mindanao (Regions IX, X, XI, XIl & Bidding Fund Mechanization P
CARAGA) lechanization Program.
U:gl;ﬁ:m:r:;:?;t&:;ni?f " Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 : FMFOD NO Cacis 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/20/2021 | 08/25/2021 Purpose 99,930,600.00 99,930,600.00] machinery under RCEF
Luzon (Regions CAR, 1, II, IlI, IV-A, Bidding '
VB2 AN Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 35 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 jUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Y 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/12/2021 Purpose 45,430,000.00 45,430,000.000 machinery under RCEF
. Bidding P
Visayas (Regions VI,VII & VIII) Fund Mechanization Program,
hoqsrdihiom L catin Soeci Pravsen o syt
310200100001000 h . FMFOD NO g 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/12/2021 Purpose 51,835,520.00 51,835,520.00] machinery under RCEF
Mindanao (Regions IX, X, XI, XIl & Bidding Fuiid ilschaniation B
CARAGA) echanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 144 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Bidp; 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 186,912,000.00 186,912,000.00 machinery under RCEF
Region | " Fund Mechanization Program
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 107 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 JUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 138,982,086.00 138,982,086.00] machinery under RCEF
Regions CAR & Il Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 157 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/12/2021 Purpose 203,864,500.00 203,864,500.00] machinery under RCEF
Region Il Fund Mechanization Program.
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Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021
(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Procurement Remarks
PMO/ Mode of Source of :
Code (PAP) Procurement Project St iaar Activity? ety MBIV R, Funds (brief description of
(Yes/No) Notice of Contract Project)
Posting of |/Opening of Rt Signing Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 111 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural

310200100001000 |Unil5 Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Biddin 05/12/2021 | 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 | Purpose 144,166,800.00 144,166,800.00| machinery under RCEF
; 9 E o

Regions IV-A, IV-B & V Fund Mechanization Program.

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 120 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 155,856,000.00 156,856,000.00] machinery under RCEF

Region VI Fund Mechanization Program.

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 118 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits Four-Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 10/19/2021 | 10/21/2021 Purpose 153,305,364.00 153,305,364.00] machinery under RCEF

Regions VIl & Vil Fund Mechanization Program.

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 93 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits Four Wheel Tractors for FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 | 06/04/2021 | 08/20/2021 | 08/25/2021 Purpose 120,714,000.00 120,714,000.00] machinery under RCEF

Regions IX, X and CARAGA Fund Mechanization Program.

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 100 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 'Units Four Wheel Tractor for FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 | 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/13/2021 Purpose 129,890,000.00 129,890,000.00] machinery under RCEF

Regions XI, XIl and BARMM Fund Mechanization Program,

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 53

Units PTO Driven Disc Plow/Harrow Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 Jimplement for Four-Wheel Tractor FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 18,550,000.00 18,550,000.00] machinery under RCEF

Ifor Luzon (Regions CAR I, 1, IIl, IV- Fund Mechanization Program.

A, IV-B & V)

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 23

Units PTO Driven Disc Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 |Plow/Harrow Implement for Four- FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 8,050,000.00 8,050,000.00] machinery under RCEF

Wheel Tractor for Visayas (Regions Fund Mechanization Program.

VI VL& VI

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 38

Units PTO Driven Disc Plow/Harrow Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 |implement For Four-Wheel Tractor FMFOD NO Bidding 05/12/2021 06/04/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 13,300,000.00 13,300,000.00§ machinery under RCEF

for Mindanao (Regions IX, X, XI, XII Fund Mechanization Program.

& CARAGA)

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 41 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits 65-85HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO Bidding 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 77,531,000.00 77,531,000.00] machinery under RCEF

Harvesters for Regions CAR & Il Fund Mechanization Program

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 29 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  jUnits 65-85HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO Bidding 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 54,824,152.00 54,824,152.00] machinery under RCEF

Harvesters for Region 1l Fund Mechanization Program
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Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021
(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Procurement Remarks
PMO/ Mode of Source of
Activity? i
Code (PAP) Procurement Project End-User Y ﬂ:v Procursment AdvorﬁumentlISubmiuion] Funds (brief description of
(Yes/No) Notice of Contract Project)
Posting of |/Opening of Award Slisesin Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids -
- — ) e
5:::2%5—0891’:::%&6;:;?3: ” Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 : FMFOD NO ‘ 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/13/2021 Purpose 100,269,640.00 100,269,640.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Regions IV-A, IV-B & Bidding F iy
" und Mechanization Program
ﬁ:?;'és_ose;:;w;g (.!-Jz:fgi% :f 53 Competiive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 . 1 FMFOD NO #hi 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 100,212,400.00 100,212,400.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Visayas (Regions VI, Bidding Ji s
Fund Mechanization Program.
Vil & VIl
lsj:?tslé&%eshl:;w;g: :-Jz:ltl:s\: o Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 . i FMFOD NO b 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 102,211,200.00 102,211,200.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Mindanao (Regions Bidding Fund Slechintestion Profiram
IX, X, Xll & CARAGA) rog
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 22 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits 86-93 HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO Bidding 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/12/2021 Purpose 41,536,990.00 41,536,990.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Regions | & X Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 36 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits 65-85HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO Biddin 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 68,076,000.00 68,076,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Regions CAR & Il 9 Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 10 Compettive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits 65-85HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO Bidding 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 18,918,880.00 18,918,880.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Region Il Fund Mechanization Program.
Onte Fics 850611P Combine. Competitve Specia Provison of agricuural
310200100001000 ; FMFOD NO el 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 60,529,440.00 60,529,440.00) machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Regions IV-A, IV-B & Bidding ot dls
% Fund Mechanization Program.
3:::2%5:2?&:? l(a)::'tr:‘i?t: " Competitive . Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 . ; FMFQOD NO g 05/04/2021 06/08/2021 | 12/10/2021 on-going Purpose 77,614,640.00 77,614,640.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Visayas (Regions VI, Bidding By ¢
Fund Mechanization Program,
VI & VI
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 31 i L :
Units 85-85HP Rice Combine Competitive ey Pogpeiuion.of sgrimaiesl
310200100001000 2 : FMFOD NO i 05/04/2021 | 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 58,676,800.00 58,676,800.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Mindanao (Regions Bidding Fund Mechanization P
IX, XI, XIl & CARAGA) e
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 13 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  jUnits 86-93 HP Combine Harvesters] FMFOD NO Bidp; - 05/04/2021 | 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/13/2021 Purpose 24,544 585.00 24,544 585.00] machinery under RCEF
for Regions | & X r 9 Fund Mechanization Program
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 77 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits 65-85HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO Bidding 05/04/2021 | 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 145,530,000.00 145,530,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Regions CAR & | Fund Mechanization Program.
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Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021

(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
PMO/ Procurement Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Project Activity? | Mode of I Source of (brief description of
End-User (Yes/No) Procurement | Advertisement/|Submission Notice of R Funds Project)
Posting of |/Opening of e s Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids e
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 63 c " Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |Units 65-85HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO °é'.‘§:"""° 05/04/2021 | 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 | Purpose 119,188,944.00 119,188,944.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Region Il g Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 142 c e Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  Units 65-85HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO ‘;“;p:"t"’e 05/04/2021 | 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/13/2021 | Purpose 268,528,390.00 268,528,390.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Region Il ing Fund Mechanization Program.
orrs o 1
Pl . ) o Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 ﬂ:'rfessfefg': Eﬁoﬁimﬁm o | FmFoD NO C°é’.‘:;:"“ 05/04/2021 | 06/09/2021 | 08r12/2021 | 081912021 | Purpose 135,939,240.00 135,939,240.00] machinery under RCEF
" ) iading Fund Mechanization Program.
]Supply, Delivery and Testing of 87 c =2 Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits 65-85HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO °B'T‘:§""”° 05/04/2021 | 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 | Purpose 164,673,600.00 164,673,600.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Region VI i Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 27 c - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits 65-B5HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO °;'i‘d":"“"° 05/04/2021 | 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 | Purpose 51,105,600.00 51,105,600.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Region VII ing Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 50 c it Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |Units 85-B5HP Rice Combine FMFOD NO ‘;Td": "We | osi04r2021 | 06/09/2021 | 081212021 | 0811912021 | Purpose 94,602,250.00 94,602,250.00| machinery under RCEF
IHarvesters for Region VIII ing Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 71 ; o N |
Units 65-85 HP Rice Combine Competitive Special Provision of agr lCU“UfEF
310200100001000 . FMFOD NO e 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 133,962,800.00 133,962,800.00] machinery under RCE!
Harvesters for Regions IX, X, Bidding E Mechanization Program
CARAGA und .
3:%%5%35'::"}'}:22 ég:m: ee Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 : FMFOD NO bt 05/04/2021 06/09/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/12/2021 Purpose 124,608,000.00 124,608,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Harvesters for Regions XI, XII, Bidding e
Fund Mechanization Program.
BARMM
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 15 ; - icultural
units Walk-Behind Type Mechanical Competitive Special Provision of agricultura
310200100001000 ko Transplanters for Luzon FMFOD NO Biddin 05/04/2021 | 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 | Purpose 4,800,000.00 4,800,000.00| machinery under RCEF
i s Fund Mechanization Program.
(Regions |1, I, IV-A, IV-B and V)
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 7 ) o ccultural
units Walk-Behind Type Mechanical Competitive Special Provision of agricultura
310200100001000 & Y FMFOD NO A 05/04/2021 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 08/16/2021 Purpose 2,345,000.00 2,345,000.00f] machinery under RCEF
Rice Transplanters for Visayas Bidding Fund Mechanization Program
(Regions VI,VII & VIII) un ‘
f:ifs?ma?ﬂg:ﬁnzn? Tesntiil:gcnoafr:igm C titi Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 o o anters le:iﬂin i FMFOD NO °E;‘d";r:é"e 05/04/2021 | 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 | Purpose 3,350,000.00 3.350,000.00] machinery under RCEF
(Regions IX, XI, XIl & CARAGA) Fund Mechanization Program.

Page 5 of 25




Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021
(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
PO Procurement Mods of s ' Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Project Activity? e | hmce > (brief description of
End-User (Yes/No) | Procurement | Advertisement/|Submission Funds
Notice of Contract Project)
Posting of |/Opening of Awnrd e Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids gning
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 8 g o
p : ; . Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  [UNits Walk-Behind Type Mechanical | -, NO Competitive | e /042001 | 0611512021 | 0811212021 | 081612021 | Purpose 2,560,000.00 2,560,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Rice Transplanters for Luzon Bidding Fund Mechanization Pr
(Regions II, IIl, IV-A, IV-B and V) CRRERN ETogien.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 3 ' - "
2 . g 2 Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |UNits Walk-Behind Type Mechanical | pyyc iy NO Competitive | o5/040001 | 061512021 | 0811272021 | 08162021 | Purpose 975,000.00 975,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Rice Transplanters for Visayas Bidding Fund Mecharizstion Brodeam
(Regions VI, VIl & V) ogrem.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 9 o .
e A - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |units Walk-Behind Type Mechanical | ) NO Compstitive | o50am021 | 061152021 | 08r12r2021 | o8rerz021 | Purpose 2,970,000.00 2,970,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Rice Transplanters for Mindanao Bidding Fund Mechanization Progr
(Regions IX, X, XI & XII) ogram
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 65
units Walk-Behind Type Mechanical Comostiive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 Rice Transplanters for Luzon FMFOD NO Bidp;n 05/04/2021 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 19,500,000.00 19,500,000.00] machinery under RCEF
(Regions CAR, |, I, IV-A, IV-B and 9 Fund Mechanization Program
lSuppIy. Delivery and Testing of 90 . - ’
X e i - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |UNits Walk-Behind Type Mechanical |  cyicpy NO Competitive | 45042021 | 061152021 | 081272021 | 08162021 | Purpose 27,900,000.00 27,900,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Rice Transplanters for Visayas Bidding Fund Mechanization P
(Regions VI, VIl & Vill) e L LY DR,
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 74
units Walk-Behind Type Mechanical Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 JRice Transplanters for Mindanao FMFOD NO Bid?in 05/04/2021 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 22,200,000.00 22,200,000.00] machinery under RCEF
(Regions IX, X, XI, XIl, CARAGA & 9 Fund Mechanization Program
BARMM)
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 12 ; i .
EE Lt ;s : - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUNts Riding Type Mechanical Rice | cyicypy NO Competitive | ci040021 | 0611512021 | 0811212021 | 081612021 | Purpose 12,948,000.00 12,948,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Luzon (Regions II, Bidding Fund Mechiinisation Brocrai
Iil, IV-B and V) ognam,;
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 11 " s A
et ; " - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |U"its Riding Type Mechanical Rice | cyucny NO Competitive | 5042021 | 0611512021 | 0811212021 | 081612021 | Purpose 13,035,000.00 13,035,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Visayas (Regions Bidding <l
Fund Mechanization Program.
VI, VIl & Vi)
ISupply, Delivery and Testing of 9 i A5 :
byt . ¢ - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUNts Riding Type Mechanical Rice | y\cp NO Competitive | 050412021 | 06/15/2021 | 08112/2021 | 08/16/2021 | Purpose 9,800,000.00 9,900,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Mindanao Bidding Fund Machantzation P
(Regions XI, Xl & CARAGA) CEANSTISERAN] Eowram.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 8 ? i )
g J ; - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |Unts Riding Type Mechanical Rice | cyyeqp, NO Competitve I 51042021 | 061152021 | 0811212021 | 081612021 | Purpose 8,680,000.00 8,680,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Luzon (Regions Il Bidding Ll
iil, IV-B and V) Fund Mechanization Program.
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Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021
(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Procurement Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Project iyl i i S~ (brief description of
End-User (Yes/No) Procurement | Advertisement/|Submission Funds
i Notice of Contract Project)
Posting of |/Opening of At Signin Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids e
ISupply, Delivery and Testing of 6 i co
S . § . Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUNts Riding Type Mechanical Rice | = pyycpy NO Competitve | c0am021 | 06/152021 | 08/12/2021 | 0862021 | Purpose 6,720,000.00 6,720,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Visayas (Regions Bidding B4
Fund Mechanization Program.
VI, VI & Vi)
S: :tjsp gld?: '“_'I_B"V a:lil:::;gloéia Competitive Syaciel PN of agrevieal
310200100001000 - e FMFOD NO s 05/04/2021 | 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 5,600,000.00 5,600,000.00] machinery under RCEF
ransplanters for Mindanao Bidding el
; Fund Mechanization Program.
(Regions XI & XII)
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 25 ) - "
2 e i ; ; Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |U"its Riding Type Mechanical Rice | o NO Competitve | o5i0412021 | 06/15/2021 | o8r12/2021 | oerer2021 | Purpose 29,375,000.00 29,375,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Luzon (Regions |, Bidding Fund Mechanization Program
I, 11, IV-A, IV-B and V) 9
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 86 Gomatitve Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  Junits Riding Type Mechanical Rice FMFOD NO Bid%ein 05/04/2021 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 87,720,000.00 87,720,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Region VI 9 Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 29 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 Junits Riding Type Mechanical Rice FMFOD NO Bidpr;n 05/04/2021 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 816/2021 Purpose 31,030,000.00 31,030,000.00) machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Region VI 9 Fund Mechanization Program
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 55 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  Junits Riding Type Mechanical Rice FMFCD NO Bidp(; 05/04/2021 06/15/2021 | 08/12/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 57,750,000.00 57,750,000.00) machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Region VIlI "9 Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 36 ; i
il bl . : - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |U"t® Riding Type Mechanical Rice | cycop NO Competitive | oq0a2021 | 061572021 | 0811272021 | 08612021 | Purpose 38,880,000,00 38,880,000.00] machinery under RCEF
Transplanters for Mindanao Bidding Fund Machanizetion Proar
(Regions IX, X, XI, XIl & CARAGA) ) i
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 12 ’ i3 y
oS4 A - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 [V Rice Precision Sesders for FMFOD NO Competitive | o506/0021 | 061222021 | 0811172021 | 081172021 | Purpose 20,135,500.00 20,135,500.00| machinery under RCEF
Luzon (Regions CAR, I, II, Ill, IV-A, Bidding e
Fund Mechanization Program.
IV-B & V)
e bk Tl Competiive Speci Provison o agricutural
310200100001000 v FMFOD NO e 05/06/2021 06/22/2021 N/A N/A Purpose 16,779,500.00 16,779,500.00] machinery under RCEF
Precision Seeders for Visayas Bidding Eind Machafization Proceseni
(Regions VI, VII & VIll) N s i
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 14 I 2 ?
il A - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 |- nits Rice Precision Seeders for FMFOD NO Competitive | os062021 | 0612272021 | 0811172021 | 0811172021 | Purpose 23,491,500.00 23,491,500.00] machinery under RCEF
Mindanao (Regions IX, X, XI, XII, Bidding Fund Mechanizaton Proam
CARAGA & BARMM) o,
B:?tzwi'?ice Reapers for Lu]zn:;:lnu‘i - Competitive i s i, oo
310200100001000 A FMFOD NO 13 05/06/2021 | 06/22/2021 | 08/11/2021 | 08/18/2021 Purpose 22,692,500.00 22,692,500.00] machinery under RCEF
(Regions CAR, 1, II, 1ll, IV-A, IV-B & Bidding R
Fund Mechanization Program.

A
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Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021
(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Procurement Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Project by Activity? M of Soums of (brief description of
End-User | (veg/No) | Procurement advertisement/[Submission Funds P
Notice of Contract roject)
Posting of |/Opening of promth Sianin Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids e

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 156 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 JUnits Rice Reapers for Visayas FMFOD NO Bidpc: 05/06/2021 06/22/2021 | 11/04/2021 | 11/05/2021 Purpose 24,492,000.00 24,492,000.00| machinery under RCEF
(Regions VI,VII & VIII) ng Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 94 Cohusiibeg Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 JUnits Rice Reapers for Mindanao FMFOD NO Bid? 05/06/2021 06/22/2021 | 11/04/2021 | 11/05/2021 Purpose 14,758,000.00 14,758,000.00| machinery under RCEF
(Regions IX, X, XI, XIl & BARMM) ing Fund Mechanization Program.
Supply and Delivery and Testing of Competitiv Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  §159 units Walking-Type Agricultural FMFOD NO Bid'?in . 05/28/2021 06/23/2021 N/A N/A Purpose 24,247,500.00 24,247,500.00] machinery under RCEF
Tractors for Regions CAR, | & Il 9 Fund Mechanization Program.,

Supply and Delivery and Testing of ) =i i
. bz : - Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 |10 units Walking-Type Agricultural | - ey NO Competitive | 50812021 | 06232021 |  nA NIA Purpose 24,247,500.00 24,247,500.00] machinery under RCEF

Tractors for Regions I, IV-A, IV-B & Bidding e
Fund Mechanization Program.
ISupply and Delivery and Testing of Competitiv Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 167 units Walking-Type Agricultural FMFOD NO Biﬁp:in v 05/28/2021 06/23/2021 NIA N/A Purpose 25,467,500.00 25,467,500.00] machinery under RCEF
Tractors for Regions VI & VII 9 Fund Mechanization Program.
ISupply and Delivery and Testing of Sameetite Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |128 units Walking-Type Agricultural FMFOD NO L 05/28/2021 06/23/2021 N/IA N/A Purpose 19,520,000.00 19,520,000.00] machinery under RCEF
h Bidding e

Tractors for Region VIII Fund Mechanization Program.

ISupply and Delivery and Testing of _ s .
; el : " Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 |25 units Walking-Type Agricultural | - ey NO Competitve | 580021 |oer232021|  wia N/A Purpose 20,587,500.00 20,587,500.00] machinery under RCEF
Tractors for Mindanao (Regions IX, Bidding Fund Machanizalion Prograin
X, XI, XIl, CARAGA & BARMM) i oarem.

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 60 ) " .
Unﬁ:g 81.2 torynlhr Snap 9 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 rafich ; FMFOD NO K 05/11/2021 06/02/2021 N/A N/A Purpose 9,437,880.00 9,437,880.00] machinery under RCEF
on/Detachable Axial-Flow Threshers Bidding Fund Mischaniation Progrim
for Visayas (Regions VI, Vil & VIII) Ll 2 g
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 6 Compstitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  jUnits 0.8-1.2 ton/hr Axial-Flow FMFOD NO Bidpt;n 05/11/2021 | 06/02/2021 | 08/11/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 943,728.00 943,728.00] machinery under RCEF
Threshers for Regions CAR & Il 9 Fund Mechanization Program,
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 11 Competitt Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 JUnits 0.8-1.2 ton/hr Axial-Flow FMFOD NO Badp; . 05/11/2021 06/02/2021 N/A N/A Purpose 1,730,278.00 1,730,278.00] machinery under RCEF
Threshers for Regions X1 & Xl ng Fund Mechanization Program.

| li ing of 187 s 3
3:5:: EBE-): ;:3: f:r:dsl':stgto 8 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 b p FMFOD NO ! pe 05/11/2021 06/02/2021 | 08/11/2021 | 08/16/2021 Purpose 29,412,856.00 29,412,856.00] machinery under RCEF
Detachable Axial-Flow Threshers for| Bidding r Mézhanteation Proarsin
Regions I, Il, IV-A, IV-B & V A TG (.

Supply, Delivery and Testing of 101 ; - i
i » Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 | "8 0.8-1.:2 tonhr Snap on/ FMFOD NO Competitve | n5411021 | osi02i2021]  nia N/A Purpose 15,887,098.00 15,887,008.00] machinery under RCEF
Detachable Axial-Flow Threshers for| Bidding Fund Machantzation P e
Regions IX, X & BARMM e g e
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Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021
(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
PO/ Procurement Mode of s 1 Remarks
Code (PAP) Procurement Project Activity? .o I Hen 9 (brief description of
End-User Yes/No) Procurement | Advertisement/|Submission Funds
( Notice of Contract Project)
Posting of |/Opening of Anid Sicaky Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids e
Supply, Delivery, Installation,
Testing and Commissioning of 17 Comsaliieg Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  jUnits Rice Mill with Impeller Huller FMFOD NO i 05/11/2021 06/02/2021 N/A N/A Purpose 10,200,000.00 10,200,000.00] machinery under RCEF
3 Bidding L2
or Luzon (Regions CAR, I, Il I, IV- Fund Mechanization Program.
B&V)
Supply, Delivery, Installation,
Testing and Commissioning of 14 Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  JUnits Rice Mill with Impeller Huller FMFOD NO Bidpc:rl 05/11/2021 06/02/2021 N/A N/A Purpose 8,400,000.00 8,400,000.00] machinery under RCEF
for Visayas and Mindanao (Regions 9 Fund Mechanization Program
VI VIL VL X, X XI & CARAGA)
- 40,000 pcs Various Advocacy T-
|Shirts and Long Sleeves
- 30,000 pcs Advocacy T-shirts for =2
JUCHR SERCNON O AT Competiti Spacial mafar;‘::fzfr:: d;ﬁn?ach
310200100002000 |- 5,000 pcs Advocacy Long Sleeves | FMFOD NO it 05/15/2021 06/10/2021 | 08/20/2021 | 08/31/2021 Purpose 4,360,000.00 4,360,000.00 = el
: Bidding trainings and promotional
|for Operator-Trainees of TMTD Fund rdiatiin
- 5,000 pcs Advocacy T-shirts for
Workshop-Participants of EDD
Special Provision of advocacy
310200100002000 |22000 Pes Advocacy Hat (Boonie | pyycqp NO Competiive | 015021 | 06102021 | 082372021 | 0910272021 | Purpose 2,352,000.00 2,352,000.00 coltaterals during PHilMech
\Variation) Bidding Fund trainings and promotional
materials
Special Provision of advocacy
10,000 pcs Briefing Kit Sleeve with Competitive collaterals during PHilMech
310200100002000 IString (Advocacy drawstring bag) FMFOD NO Bidding 05/15/2021 06/10/2021 | 08/23/2021 | 09/02/2021 P:T::e §70,000.00 570,000.00 ainings and promotional
materials
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Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021
(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Code (PAP)

Procurement Project

PMO/
End-User

Is this an
Early
Procurement
Activity?
(Yes/No)

Mode of
Procurement

Schedule for Each Procurement Activity

Advertisement/
Posting of
IB/REI

Submission
/Opening of
Bids

Notice of
Award

Contract
Signing

Source of
Funds

Estimated Budget (PhP)

Total

MOOE

co

Remarks
(brief description of
Project)

310200100002000

75,000 copies of O&M Manual
Series

- 15,000 copies of Operator's
Manual Series 9 (Float Assisted
Tractor)

- 15,000 copies of Operator's
Manual Series 10 (Rice Reaper)

- 15,000 copies of Operator's
Manual Series 11 (Riding Type
Transplanter)

- 15,000 copies of Operator's
Manual Series 12 (Thresher)

- 15,000 copies of Operator's
Manual Series 13 (Mobile Grain
Dryer)

FMFOD

NO

Competitive
Bidding

06/04/2021

06/25/2021 | 10/04/2021

10/05/2021

Special
Purpose
Fund

1,203,075.00

1,203,075.00

Printing and Publication of
various PHilMech's
promotional materials

310200100002000

10,000 pcs of Advocacy Wall
Calendars

10,000 pes of Advocacy Desk
Calendars

FMFOD

NO

Competitive
Bidding

06/04/2021

06/25/2021 | 10/04/2021

10/05/2021

Special
Purpose
Fund

1,100,000.00

1,100,000.00

Provision of agricultural
machinery under RCEF
Mechanization Program.

310200100002000

10,000 pcs Advocacy Info Kit

5,000 pcs Technology Leaflet (5
Kinds x 5,000 copies each) Tagalog
Version

5,000 pcs Technology Leaflet (5
Kinds x 5,000 copies each) Bisaya
\Version

15,000 pcs RCEF Mechanization
Program Flyers (3 Kinds x 5,000
copies each)

15,000 pcs RCEF Mechanization
Program Primer (3 kinds x 5,000
copies each)

FMFOD

NO

Competitive
Bidding

06/04/2021

06/25/2021 | 10/04/2021

10/05/2021

Special
Purpose
Fund

840,000.00

840,000.00

Printing and Publication of
various PHilMech's
promotional materials
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Philippine Center for Postharvest Development and Mechanization (PHilMech) Annual Procurement Plan for FY 2021
(Changes within the 2nd Semester)

Is this an
Early Schedule for Each Procurement Activity Estimated Budget (PhP)
Procurement Remarks
PMO/ Mode of Source of
j Activity? " i
Code (PAP) Procurement Project End-User (Yu.f:{)) Prasmmnentt Lagiusasniit Submisnionl . Funds (brief description of
. Notice of Contract Project)
Posting of |/Opening of Awiisd Signin Total MOOE co
IB/REI Bids gning
10,000 pcs Extension Notebook with
Ballpen
6,000 pcs Program Posters
. P
(hﬁﬁggapc: :arog?g;:) e Competitive Special Printing and Publication of
Ty FMFOD NO Bidding 06/04/2021 06/25/2021 N/A N/A Purpose 1,800,000.00 1,800,000.00 various PHilMech's
. 2,000 pcs Program Posters Fund promotional materials
(Benepisyo ng Mekanisasyon)
- 2,000 pcs Program Posters
(Arangkada Package)
2,000 copies of RCEF Annual
Report 2021
3,000 copies of Book (Kwentong
Makinarya) Competitive Special Printing and Publication of
310200100002000 FMFOD NO Biddin 06/04/2021 | 06/25/2021 | 10/04/2021 | 10/05/2021 Purpose 978,000.00 978,000.00 various PHilMech's
2,000 copies of Mechanization 9 Fund promotional materials
Digest 2021
20,000 pcs RCEF Mechanization
Program Newsletter
Supply, Delivery and Testing of 172 FMFOD/ NP-52.1 Two Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000 JUnits Mechanical Rice Thresher: various NO Failed éiddin & 1st Quarter Purpose 29,347,500.00 20,347,500.00] machinery under RCEF
Axial-Flow (Snap on/Detachable) farmers 9 Fund Mechanization Program,
Rebidding for the Supply, Delivery,
Installation, Testing and Competitive Special Provision of agricultural
310200100001000  |Commissioning of 17 Units Rice Mill| FMFOD NO Biddin 07/20/2021 | 09/07/2021 | 11/05/2021 | 12/06/2021 Purpose 10,198,096.00 10,198,096.00] machinery under RCEF
with Impeller Huller for Luzon 9 Fund Mechanization Program.
(Regions CAR, |, II, Ill, IV-B & V)
Rebidding for the Supply, Delivery,
Installation, Testing and 4 - "
P e Ri ; i Special Provision of agricultural
Commissioning of 14 Units Rice Mill Competitive ;
310200100001000 with Impeller Huller for Visayas and FMFOD NO Bidding 07/20/2021 | 09/07/2021 | 11/05/2021 | 12/06/2021 P:rf::e 8,398,432.00 8,398,432.00 :ac:mgry gnder RCEF
Mindanao (Regions VI, Vil, VIII, IX, lechanization Program.
X, XI & CARAGA)
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